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In one month’s time, seventeen-year-old Cara Tillman will die and be reborn from her own ashes…

Her life of secrecy has never been easy. She’s watched her younger brother, Jeremy, burn and rise again in a
coming-of-age process called rebirth. And just like her brother, when her time comes, she won’t remember
anything from her first life other than she’s a Phoenix—a member of a small group of people descended
from the mythical Phoenix bird.

The last thing she needs to worry about is falling for the new guy in town—Logan Schmidt.

Cara is drawn to Logan in a way she can’t explain, but she’s not exactly complaining. Everything is
perfect…except it’s not. Once she’s reborn, she’ll forget Logan. And to make things worse, a Phoenix
Hunter is on the loose, and Cara’s involvement with Logan is bringing out her Phoenix qualities—the very
qualities that will draw the Hunter right to her.

Desperate times call for desperate measures…

Afraid of hurting Logan, Cara breaks it off for good. But her attraction to him runs deeper than a typical high
school crush. She wants him—needs him. And if he proves willing to stay by her side, their love might
destroy them both.

Can Cara hide from the Phoenix Hunters long enough to survive her rebirth? And if so, will it mean a new
beginning with Logan—or the beginning of the end?
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From reader reviews:

Jessica Peacock:

The particular book Into The Fire will bring you to the new experience of reading a book. The author style to
spell out the idea is very unique. If you try to find new book to read, this book very acceptable to you. The
book Into The Fire is much recommended to you to study. You can also get the e-book from your official
web site, so you can quicker to read the book.

Earl Hess:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always try to and must have the free time or they will get lot of
stress from both everyday life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have extra time, we will say
absolutely without a doubt. People is human not really a robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of activity
do you have when the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer will unlimited right. Then do
you try this one, reading books. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, the actual book you
have read is definitely Into The Fire.

Gwen Anderson:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make you to
definitely understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information much easier
to share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon. You
can see that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. The book that recommended to you is
Into The Fire this book consist a lot of the information from the condition of this world now. This book was
represented just how can the world has grown up. The words styles that writer require to explain it is easy to
understand. Often the writer made some study when he makes this book. That's why this book acceptable all
of you.

Ricky Dotson:

Publication is one of source of information. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen want book to know the revise information of year to help year. As we know
those textbooks have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the
world. By book Into The Fire we can consider more advantage. Don't you to definitely be creative people?
For being creative person must like to read a book. Just simply choose the best book that acceptable with
your aim. Don't become doubt to change your life by this book Into The Fire. You can more attractive than
now.
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