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Sullivan “Spook” Smiley, a vicious post-Revolutionary War pirate, amassed a treasure worth tens of millions
of dollars through the early 19th Century, and then vanished. His treasure never surfaced, and neither did any
clues to where it might be. Until now. Judson Davis woke one Sunday morning in his apartment on the east
end of Portland, Maine with a mind-splitting hangover and a strange, smooth stone in his pocket. The
mischievous thirtysomething can’t remember at first exactly how he’d come to possess the rock, but he has
reason to believe that it once belonged to the legendary Captain Smiley. The stone reveals a code that
inspires Judson to enlist his lifelong best friend in a madcap race to track down Smiley’s treasure on the
southern coast of Maine. At the same time across town, two dangerous con-men have set their sights on
Shamus McGeary, a lonely, 70 year old trust fund billionaire from one of Portland’s oldest old-money
families. Determined to con the pirate enthusiast out of a few thousand dollars by selling him fake
paraphernalia, the crooks are instead recruited by a shady black market dealer to manipulate Shamus into
searching for Smiley’s treasure themselves. The result is a fast-paced comic caper, as the two groups collide
in their race to decode the centuries-old messages that lead to millions of dollars in buried treasure.
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From reader reviews:

Jeffrey Thompson:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
Sure, you can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time
to take a wander, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or maybe read a book titled
Booty? Maybe it is being best activity for you. You know beside you can spend your time along with your
favorite's book, you can more intelligent than before. Do you agree with its opinion or you have some other
opinion?

Evelyn Looney:

What do you about book? It is not important along? Or just adding material when you require something to
explain what yours problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy man or woman? If you don't have
spare time to complete others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have time? What did you
do? Everyone has many questions above. They must answer that question due to the fact just their can do in
which. It said that about publication. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is right. Because start from on
jardín de infancia until university need that Booty to read.

Kerry Maye:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be change about what going on or information even
knowledge to make these individuals keep up with the era which is always change and move forward. Some
of you maybe can update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the
problems coming to anyone is you don't know what kind you should start with. This Booty is our
recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why, since this book serves what you want and need in
this era.

Viola Ball:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got students? We believe that that query
was given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. And you
also know that little person like reading or as studying become their hobby. You need to understand that
reading is very important as well as book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to incorporate you
knowledge, except your personal teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update with regards to something
by book. A substantial number of sorts of books that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them is
Booty.
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